T Citisco Owens Equipment Mobile Fixture Kamran & Company
-02, Kitchen
Equipment
Quanity Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes
uanti
Hobart Dishwasher w/
Pant Legs As Per 1 30 Days $30,493.02 $30,493.02 3 Weeks $32,920.00 $32,920.00 4-6 Weeks $34,893.27 $34,893.27 4 Weeks $33,368.42 $33,368.42
Specifications
Mé";ji A_s Per 2 30 Days $3,056.89 $6,113.78 True TMC-58-S-SS-HC 1 Week $2,743.00 $5,486.00 True TMC58 4-6 Weeks $3,364.17 $6,728.34 Need ‘°:i‘:|:§:";“ model 2 Weeks $5,356.12 $10,712.24 True TMC-58
Walk In Cooler Wire Complete.
Shelving As Per Se:x 30 Days $2,536.76 $2,536.76 2 Weeks $2,080.00 $2,080.00 4-6 Weeks $2,448.88 $2,448.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Specifications P
P:sss:;':r;pzi:;::ag:;i‘:r 1 30 Days $10,500.61 $10,500.61 4 Weeks $11,750.00 $11,750.00 4-6 Weeks $11,263.82 $11,263.82 3-4 Weeks $10,604.78 $10,604.73
Walkin Cooler Shelving  Complete| ;o $4,976.67 $4,976.67 2 Weeks $5,187.00 $5,187.00 46 Weeks $4,688.20 $4,688.20 1-2 Weeks $4,895.65 $4,895.65
As Per Specifications | Setup
Slorage Shel' As Per Comple(e 30 Days $294.00 $294.00 2 Weeks $265.00 $265.00 4-6 Weeks $303.24 $303.24 1-2 Weeks $884.12 $884.12
Specifications Setup
Total Cost $54,914.84 $57,688.00 $60,325.75 $60,465.16
NOTES Awarded contract to lowest bidder as a group.




Douglas Equipment

Norvell Fixture

BHS Foodservice

Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes
46Weeks | $35070.90 $35,07090 | Washing baskets not included. | 4 Weeks $36,420.00 $36,420.00 4 Weeks $35,002.90 $35,002.90
4 Weeks $3,545.78 $7,091.56 Beverage Air SMF58S 4 Weeks $3,295.00 $6,590.00 True TMC58-S-SS-HC 3 Weeks $3,141.20 $6,282.40 True TMC-58-5-SS-HC
46 Weeks $2,720.56 s272086 MO i""‘"’ﬁm"““ | 4 Weeks $2,248.00 $2,248.00 3 Weeks $3,004.04 $3,004.04
4-6Weeks | $11443.00 siiaao | NOMSIIaen rvidedaS g vieeks $11,440.00 $11,440.00 3 Weeks $11433.00 $11433.00
46 Weeks $4,841.05 sagaros MO i"m",::m"““ 2| 4 Weeks $4,836.00 $4,836.00 3 Weeks $4,642.46 $4,642.46
46 Weeks $442.67 $442.67 No i"“‘"‘ﬁm"ide" 3| 4 Weeks $295.00 $295.00 Metro As Specified 3 Weeks $908.56 $908.56
$61,609.74 $61,829.00 $61,363.36




Pueblo Hotel Supply Central Restaurant Manning Brothers Sam Tell
Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes Delivery Unit Cost | Extended Total Notes
30 Days $37,920.04 $37,920.04 Champion model 11/1/2019 $33,316.98 $33,316.98 46 Weeks $37,508.52 $37,508.52 60 Days $44,088.02 $44,088.02
30 Days $2,459.72 $4,919.44 12/4/2019 $3,030.41 $6,060.82 4-6 Weeks $2,873.55 $5,747.10 True TMC58 60 Days $2,733.11 $5,466.22 True TMC-58
30 Days $2,612.04 $2,612.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid 46 Weeks $2,353.16 $2,353.16 60 Days $3,636.28 $3,635.28
30 Days $11,142.98 $11,142.98 10/25/2019 $12,558.67 $12,558.67 4-6 Weeks $11,410.60 $11,410.60 60 Days $11,501.83 $11,501.83
30 Days $4,907.86 $4,907.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid 46 Weeks $4,769.37 $4,769.37 60 Days $5,426.11 $5,426.11
30 Days $161.61 $161.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4-6 Weeks $287.60 $287.60 60 Days $274.80 $274.80 Eagle 1826C63-5
$61,672.97 N/A $62,166.35 $71,292.26




